
B.C.C. - SEMINOLE COUNTY, FL
BID TABULATION SHEET

IFB-604201-21/CAR  

Term Contract for Waste Tire Recycling Services 

IFB NUMBER: 

IFB TITLE: 

DUE DATE:   October 20th, 2021 at 2:00 P.M.  

ALL SUBMITTALS ACCEPTED BY  SEMINOLE COUNTY ARE SUBJECT TO THE COUNTY'S TERMS 
AND CONDITIONS AND ANY AND ALL ADDITIONAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS SUBMITTED BY 
THE BIDDERS ARE REJECTED AND SHALL HAVE NO FORCE AND EFFECT.  IFB DOCUMENTS 
FROM THE BIDDERS LISTED HEREIN ARE THE ONLY SUBMITTALS RECEIVED TIMELY AS OF 
THE ABOVE DUE DATE AND TIME.  ALL OTHER IFB DOCUMENTS SUBMITTED IN RESPONSE TO 
THIS SOLICITATION, IF ANY, ARE HEREBY REJECTED AS LATE. 

BIDDER: 

Empire Tire of Edgewater LLC. 
4888 W. Colonial Dr.   
Orlando, FL 32808 

(321) 303-2096 – Phone
(407) 250-5875 – Fax

Clifton J. McFadden Jr.  
empiretire@hotmail.com 

Tabulated by:  Cassandra Reyes, Senior Procurement Analyst (Posted 10/26/2021 @ 12:30 PM)
Recommendation and Intent to Award: Empire Tire of Edgewater LLC. (Posted 11/2/21 @1:00PM)
BCC for Award: December 14th, 2021
 

mailto:empiretire@hotmail.com


I. OFF SITE RECYCLING Price Per Ton Tonnage Mileage Cost per Mileage Loads per year Total
Price with County Hauling

(a.) DOT Waste Tires (rimmed and de-rimmed) 130.00$        375 48,750.00$   
(b.) Oversized (NON-DOT Tires) (rimmed and de-rimmed) 250.00$        1 250.00$        
(c.) Hauling Costs (round trip) 86 2.00$                      25.00$               4,300.00$     

53,300.00$  

Price with Contractor Hauling 
(a.) DOT Waste Tires (rimmed and de-rimmed) 167.00$        375 62,625.00$   
(b.) Oversized (NON-DOT Tires) (rimmed and de-rimmed) 350.00$        1 350.00$        

62,975.00$  

II. ON-SITE RECYCLING 
DOT Waste Tires (rimmed and de-rimmed) No Bid

III. Tire Chips (nominal 3") and other Recycled Products 
(Option)

(1) 3" Tire Chips 
(a.) Contractor Delivers - Dedicated Trip 50.00$          
(b.) Contractor Delivers - with Back Haul 40.00$          
(c.) County pick ups 30.00$          

(2) Identify other products for sale No Bid 
(a.) Contractor Delivers - Dedicated Trip No Bid 
(b.) Contractor Delivers - with Back Haul No Bid 
(c.) County pick ups No Bid 

(3)  Identify other products for sale No Bid 
(a.) Contractor Delivers - Dedicated Trip No Bid 
(b.) Contractor Delivers - with Back Haul No Bid 
(c.) County pick ups No Bid 

Contractor Hauling Costs - TOTAL

County Hauling Costs - TOTAL




